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Piper's world is dying. Each day brings hotter temperatures and heat bubbles which threaten to destroy the
Earth. Amid this Global Heating Crisis, Piper lives under the oppressive rule of her mother, who suffocates
her even more than the weather does. Everything changes on her eighteenth birthday, when her mother is
called away on a mysterious errand and Piper seizes her first opportunity for freedom.

Piper discovers a universe she never knew existed—a sphere of gods and monsters—and realizes that her
world is not the only one in crisis. While gods battle for control of the Underworld, Piper's life spirals out of
control as she struggles to find the answer to the secret that has been kept from her since birth—her very
identity….

An imaginative melding of mythology and dystopia, Solstice is the first YA novel by talented newcomer P. J.
Hoover.
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From reader reviews:

Brian Grant:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of new
facts. When you read a guide you will get new information mainly because book is one of many ways to
share the information as well as their idea. Second, reading through a book will make an individual more
imaginative. When you examining a book especially fiction book the author will bring you to imagine the
story how the personas do it anything. Third, you can share your knowledge to some others. When you read
this Solstice, you may tells your family, friends and also soon about yours publication. Your knowledge can
inspire the others, make them reading a e-book.

Mitchell Smith:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you actually, why because this Solstice e-book written by well-
known writer whose to say well how to make book that can be understand by anyone who all read the book.
Written throughout good manner for you, leaking every ideas and creating skill only for eliminate your
hunger then you still doubt Solstice as good book not simply by the cover but also with the content. This is
one guide that can break don't evaluate book by its deal with, so do you still needing one more sixth sense to
pick that!? Oh come on your looking at sixth sense already told you so why you have to listening to yet
another sixth sense.

Diana Chung:

You are able to spend your free time to learn this book this book. This Solstice is simple to deliver you can
read it in the park, in the beach, train and soon. If you did not include much space to bring often the printed
book, you can buy the e-book. It is make you simpler to read it. You can save the actual book in your smart
phone. Therefore there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Jean McCallum:

E-book is one of source of expertise. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen require book to know the update information of year for you to year. As we
know those publications have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, can bring us to
around the world. With the book Solstice we can take more advantage. Don't that you be creative people? To
become creative person must love to read a book. Only choose the best book that acceptable with your aim.
Don't become doubt to change your life with this book Solstice. You can more inviting than now.
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