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The Baseball Ground was a football stadium known all over the world for its unique atmosphere, proximity
of the crowd, odd shaped stands and the setting of the Leys factory on one side and terraced houses
everywhere else.

Although known as a football setting, it was originally designed as a baseball stadium for the Derby Baseball
Club. The baseball and football clubs co-habited the ground for a number of years, until the football club
became permanent residents and the sport of baseball faded.

For those fans fortunate to have experienced capacity crowds of the 1970s and un-forgettable matches
against Benfica, Real Madrid, Manchester United and Tottenham Hotspur, they will never forget the old
stadium.

This e-book tells the story of the area, from its beginnings as a farm, through the various stages of
development and potential re-development opportunities that were never taken, the eventual move to Pride
Park, the sale and subsequent demolition of the stadium to its re-generation into affordable housing.

There is also a comprehensive statistics section detailing the playing records against all first class opposition
and several unique top 10 lists.
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From reader reviews:

Lisa Streeter:

Hey guys, do you really wants to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the name Derby County
FC: The History of the Baseball Ground suitable to you? The book was written by famous writer in this era.
The particular book untitled Derby County FC: The History of the Baseball Groundis the main of several
books which everyone read now. This book was inspired lots of people in the world. When you read this
guide you will enter the new dimensions that you ever know before. The author explained their idea in the
simple way, and so all of people can easily to comprehend the core of this publication. This book will give
you a great deal of information about this world now. To help you see the represented of the world in this
book.

Holly Taylor:

The book Derby County FC: The History of the Baseball Ground will bring that you the new experience of
reading any book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique. In the event you try to find new book
to study, this book very suitable to you. The book Derby County FC: The History of the Baseball Ground is
much recommended to you to learn. You can also get the e-book in the official web site, so you can more
readily to read the book.

Mary Rohan:

Playing with family inside a park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with friends is thing that
usually you might have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try issue that really
opposite from that. A single activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on
roller coaster you are ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Derby County FC: The History
of the Baseball Ground, you are able to enjoy both. It is very good combination right, you still desire to miss
it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh come on its mind hangout folks. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on
its identified as reading friends.

Leon Bailey:

Some people said that they feel uninterested when they reading a book. They are directly felt that when they
get a half parts of the book. You can choose often the book Derby County FC: The History of the Baseball
Ground to make your current reading is interesting. Your skill of reading ability is developing when you
similar to reading. Try to choose straightforward book to make you enjoy to study it and mingle the
impression about book and studying especially. It is to be very first opinion for you to like to open up a book
and go through it. Beside that the e-book Derby County FC: The History of the Baseball Ground can to be a
newly purchased friend when you're really feel alone and confuse with the information must you're doing of
this time.
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