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Il professore inglese George Conway, scomparso a Bruges durante una campagna di scavo, viene ritrovato
due anni dopo, con il cranio sfondato, a pochi passi dal sito archeologico di cui era responsabile. Il caso è
affidato all’ispettrice belga Ingrid Blondeel e al collega Damian Travis di Scotland Yard, che si erano già
occupati della sparizione dell’archeologo. Ma i due investigatori hanno idee contrapposte e le indagini si
ingarbugliano.
Ingrid è convinta che nel delitto sia coinvolta Blanche Solly, la professoressa che ha preso il posto di
Conway alla direzione dello scavo. Trevis invece ritiene che l’omicidio sia legato all’ossessione di Conway
di ritrovare lo sportello del polittico di Jan van Eyck rubato dalla cattedrale di Gand nel 1934. E proprio le
vicende del maestro fiammingo si intrecciano con l’inchiesta.
Fra false piste e indizi inquietanti, il mistero s’infittisce, ma qualcosa di terribile deve ancora accadere,
rimettendo tutto in discussione.
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From reader reviews:

Raymond Harris:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also work as a life style. This
reading practice give you lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge the rest of the
information inside the book that will improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on
what kind of book you read, if you want attract knowledge just go with education and learning books but if
you want sense happy read one using theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. Often the La moglie
di Van Eyck (Syn) (Italian Edition) is kind of e-book which is giving the reader unforeseen experience.

Maria Freeman:

Exactly why? Because this La moglie di Van Eyck (Syn) (Italian Edition) is an unordinary book that the
inside of the e-book waiting for you to snap that but latter it will jolt you with the secret that inside. Reading
this book alongside it was fantastic author who also write the book in such amazing way makes the content
within easier to understand, entertaining way but still convey the meaning fully. So , it is good for you
because of not hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret it. This book will give you a lot of
rewards than the other book have got such as help improving your ability and your critical thinking means.
So , still want to hesitate having that book? If I had been you I will go to the book store hurriedly.

Calvin Lee:

In this era which is the greater particular person or who has ability in doing something more are more
valuable than other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple way to have that. What
you should do is just spending your time very little but quite enough to get a look at some books. Among the
books in the top checklist in your reading list is actually La moglie di Van Eyck (Syn) (Italian Edition). This
book which is qualified as The Hungry Hillsides can get you closer in turning out to be precious person. By
looking upwards and review this e-book you can get many advantages.

Diana Johnson:

That book can make you to feel relax. This particular book La moglie di Van Eyck (Syn) (Italian Edition)
was colorful and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book La moglie di Van Eyck (Syn) (Italian
Edition) has many kinds or genre. Start from kids until teens. For example Naruto or Investigator Conan you
can read and think you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of book are generally make you bored,
any it can make you feel happy, fun and unwind. Try to choose the best book for yourself and try to like
reading this.
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