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After the unprecedented violence of the 1864 Overland Campaign, Union Lt. Gen. Ulysses S. Grant turned
his gaze south of Richmond to Petersburg, and the key railroad junction that supplied the Confederate capital
and its defenders. Nine grueling months of constant maneuver and combat around the “Cockade City”
followed. As massive fortifications soon dominated the landscape, both armies frequently pushed each other
to the brink of disaster.

As March 1865 drew to a close, Grant planned one more charge against Confederate lines. Despite recent
successes, many viewed this latest task as an impossibility—and their trepidation had merit. “These lines
might well have been looked upon by the enemy as impregnable,” admitted Union Maj. Gen. Horatio G.
Wright, “and nothing but the most resolute bravery could have overcome them.”

Grant ordered the attack for April 2, 1865, setting the stage for a dramatic early morning bayonet charge by
his VI Corps across half a mile of open ground into the “strongest line of works ever constructed in
America.”

Dawn of Victory: Breakthrough at Petersburg by Edward S. Alexander tells the story of the men who fought
and died in the decisive battle of the Petersburg campaign. Readers can follow the footsteps of the resolute
Union attackers and stand in the shoes of the obstinate Confederate defenders as their actions decided the
fate of the nation.
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From reader reviews:

Ruben Martin:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you, why because this Dawn of Victory: Breakthrough at Petersburg,
March 25 - April 2, 1865 (Emerging Civil War Series) book written by well-known writer we are excited for
well how to make book that could be understand by anyone who all read the book. Written with good
manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas and publishing skill only for eliminate your own hunger then
you still uncertainty Dawn of Victory: Breakthrough at Petersburg, March 25 - April 2, 1865 (Emerging
Civil War Series) as good book not only by the cover but also through the content. This is one reserve that
can break don't assess book by its deal with, so do you still needing one more sixth sense to pick this
particular!? Oh come on your reading sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to an additional
sixth sense.

Whitney Mallard:

Many people spending their time by playing outside along with friends, fun activity with family or just
watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by examining a book. Ugh, do
you think reading a book can actually hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It alright you can
have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like Dawn of Victory: Breakthrough at
Petersburg, March 25 - April 2, 1865 (Emerging Civil War Series) which is having the e-book version. So ,
try out this book? Let's see.

Janice Arias:

A lot of book has printed but it is different. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You can
choose the best book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It is identified
as of book Dawn of Victory: Breakthrough at Petersburg, March 25 - April 2, 1865 (Emerging Civil War
Series). You can contribute your knowledge by it. Without leaving the printed book, it could add your
knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most crucial that, you must aware about guide. It can bring
you from one place to other place.

Henry Buford:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information from
your book. Book is published or printed or created from each source that filled update of news. On this
modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for a person. From media social like
newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic. You can add
your understanding by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just in search of the
Dawn of Victory: Breakthrough at Petersburg, March 25 - April 2, 1865 (Emerging Civil War Series) when
you needed it?
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