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From Book 1: Time may not heal all wounds--but she can.

You'd think being able to heal people with a touch would be a blessing. But to 17-year-old Remy O'Malley,
it's more like a curse.

Every injury Remy heals becomes her own. She lives in fear of the day she's forced to mend a wound from
which she can't recover--and she's desperate to keep her amazing ability a secret.

Enter Asher Blackwell, a scarred eighteen-year-old with dangerous powers of his own. Asher seems to know
more about Remy's abilities than she does--and maybe more than he's letting on. If she opens up to him, she
might find out what it truly means to be a Healer. But she'll also expose herself to capture by an old and very
determined enemy. And if they catch her, they won't just injure her.

They'll kill her.

Corrine Jackson is a San Francisco transplant, having lived on both coasts from Southern California to New
York City. For the last seven years, she has sharpened her marketing talents at Alcone Marketing, where she
has won several industry awards. She has bachelor's and master's degrees in English, and is in her third year
of Spalding University's MFA program. A recipient of a West Chester Poetry Conference scholarship, she is
also the former Editor-in-Chief of two literary magazines, including Statement (CSU, Los Angeles) and
Dash (CSU, Fullerton).
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From reader reviews:

Jennifer Wilson:

This Sense Thieves (3 Book Series) book is just not ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in your
hands. The benefit you will get by reading this book is definitely information inside this guide incredible
fresh, you will get information which is getting deeper an individual read a lot of information you will get.
That Sense Thieves (3 Book Series) without we realize teach the one who reading it become critical in
imagining and analyzing. Don't be worry Sense Thieves (3 Book Series) can bring if you are and not make
your bag space or bookshelves' come to be full because you can have it in your lovely laptop even cell
phone. This Sense Thieves (3 Book Series) having very good arrangement in word and also layout, so you
will not experience uninterested in reading.

Maria Gray:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you actually, why because this Sense Thieves (3 Book Series)
publication written by well-known writer we are excited for well how to make book which might be
understand by anyone who else read the book. Written inside good manner for you, dripping every ideas and
writing skill only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still uncertainty Sense Thieves (3 Book
Series) as good book not just by the cover but also through the content. This is one guide that can break don't
assess book by its include, so do you still needing an additional sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on
your reading sixth sense already alerted you so why you have to listening to one more sixth sense.

Dwight Hancock:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make anyone
to understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information better to share. You
can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and soon. You will see that
now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The particular book that recommended for your
requirements is Sense Thieves (3 Book Series) this reserve consist a lot of the information in the condition of
this world now. That book was represented how does the world has grown up. The words styles that writer
require to explain it is easy to understand. The actual writer made some exploration when he makes this
book. That is why this book acceptable all of you.

Richard Lawrence:

Is it an individual who having spare time in that case spend it whole day by simply watching television
programs or just lying down on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Sense Thieves (3 Book
Series) can be the response, oh how comes? A book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your
extra time by reading in this brand new era is common not a geek activity. So what these books have than the
others?
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