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This is the true story of Fu Manchu, an adult male orangutan, who relishes outsmarting his friend, zookeeper
Jerry Stones. He does just that when he escapes his enclosure at will and spends sunny days with the
elephants in another part of the zoo. At first Jerry believes his staff's carelessness allowed the crafty ape to
get out. But when that assumption proves wrong, he launches an all-out surveillance mission to discover how
Fu manages his getaways. Jerry soon discovers that Fu can open the locked door, but can't figure out how he
does it. The zookeeper removes every twig and stick that could be used as a lock pick, but Fu continues to
escape. Eventually, Fu reveals to Jerry how he did it, and is rewarded with honorary membership in the
American Association of Locksmiths.
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From reader reviews:

Katie Martinez:

The book Orangutan Houdini gives you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You need to use to
make your capable much more increase. Book can being your best friend when you getting anxiety or having
big problem with the subject. If you can make looking at a book Orangutan Houdini to be your habit, you
can get much more advantages, like add your capable, increase your knowledge about several or all subjects.
You are able to know everything if you like wide open and read a publication Orangutan Houdini. Kinds of
book are a lot of. It means that, science book or encyclopedia or some others. So , how do you think about
this book?

Ernest Maguire:

This book untitled Orangutan Houdini to be one of several books in which best seller in this year, this is
because when you read this guide you can get a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily to buy this specific
book in the book store or you can order it by way of online. The publisher with this book sells the e-book
too. It makes you easier to read this book, as you can read this book in your Smartphone. So there is no
reason to your account to past this e-book from your list.

Robert Clift:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you will get it in e-
book way, more simple and reachable. That Orangutan Houdini can give you a lot of buddies because by you
investigating this one book you have thing that they don't and make you actually more like an interesting
person. This book can be one of one step for you to get success. This guide offer you information that
possibly your friend doesn't learn, by knowing more than additional make you to be great men and women.
So , why hesitate? Let me have Orangutan Houdini.

Jarred Chisolm:

A lot of book has printed but it differs. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the very best
book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is named of book Orangutan
Houdini. You'll be able to your knowledge by it. Without making the printed book, it can add your
knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most significant that, you must aware about book. It can bring
you from one location to other place.
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