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It takes an obsessive mind to know one. And Daniel Clark knows the elusive killer he's been stalking.

He's devoted every waking minute as a profiler to find the serial killer known only as Eve. He's pored over
the crime scenes of sixteen young women who died mysterious deaths, all in underground basements or
caverns. He's delved into the killer's head and puzzled over the twisted religious overtones of the killings.

What Daniel can't possibly know is that he will be Eve's next victim. He will be the killer's first Adam. After
sixteen hopeless months, the case takes a drastic turn on a very dark night when Daniel is shot and left for
dead.

Resuscitated after twenty minutes of clinical death, Daniel finds himself haunted by the experience. He
knows he's seen the killer's face, but the trauma of dying has obscured the memory and left him with
crushing panic attacks. Nothing--not even desperate, dangerous attempts to reexperience his own death--
seems to bring him closer to finding the killer.

Then Eve strikes again, much closer to home. And Daniel's obsession explodes into a battle for his life . . .
his sanity . . . his very soul.

Enter a world of death and near death that blurs the lines between fiction and reality in a way that will leave
you stunned.

"The detail is stunning, pointing to meticulous research in FBI methods, forensic medicine, and
psychological profiling. We have to keep telling ourselves that this is fiction. At the same time, we can't help
thinking that not only could it happen, but that it will happen if we're not careful."

David M. Kiely and Christina McKenna, authors of The Dark Sacrament
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From reader reviews:

Julius Montanez:

In other case, little men and women like to read book Adam. You can choose the best book if you like
reading a book. Providing we know about how is important a new book Adam. You can add knowledge and
of course you can around the world by the book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from book you can
understand everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you can be known. About simple factor
until wonderful thing you can know that. In this era, we could open a book as well as searching by internet
product. It is called e-book. You should use it when you feel bored stiff to go to the library. Let's read.

Bettina Cutler:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the spare time or they will get
lots of stress from both lifestyle and work. So , when we ask do people have free time, we will say absolutely
indeed. People is human not really a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity do you have when the
spare time coming to an individual of course your answer will unlimited right. Then ever try this one,
reading textbooks. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, the book you have read is
Adam.

Darren Billups:

Reading can called mind hangout, why? Because if you find yourself reading a book especially book entitled
Adam the mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in most aspect that maybe unknown for
but surely can become your mind friends. Imaging every word written in a guide then become one web form
conclusion and explanation that will maybe you never get previous to. The Adam giving you yet another
experience more than blown away your thoughts but also giving you useful details for your better life with
this era. So now let us demonstrate the relaxing pattern at this point is your body and mind will likely be
pleased when you are finished reading it, like winning a sport. Do you want to try this extraordinary shelling
out spare time activity?

Valery Carpenter:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got college students? We believe that that
query was given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. And also
you know that little person such as reading or as reading through become their hobby. You need to
understand that reading is very important along with book as to be the point. Book is important thing to
increase you knowledge, except your own teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update concerning
something by book. Numerous books that can you choose to adopt be your object. One of them is actually
Adam.
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