
The Jack LeVine Mysteries: The Big Kiss-Off of
1944, Hollywood and LeVine, and Tender Is

LeVine
Andrew Bergman

Click here if your download doesn"t start automatically

http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=B0090WS0J2
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=B0090WS0J2
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=B0090WS0J2


The Jack LeVine Mysteries: The Big Kiss-Off of 1944,
Hollywood and LeVine, and Tender Is LeVine

Andrew Bergman

The Jack LeVine Mysteries: The Big Kiss-Off of 1944, Hollywood and LeVine, and Tender Is LeVine
Andrew Bergman
Three devilishly witty and thrilling noir mysteries
Stocky, sweaty, and bald, LeVine is a Jewish private detective who makes a living by being polite. But
underneath his smile lies a bulldog. In The Big Kiss-off of 1944, fledgling actress Kerry Lane comes to Jack
LeVine when a blackmailer demands a payoff to keep a series of stag films from her past out of the public
eye. Lured by long legs and a roll of crisp twenties, LeVine takes Kerry’s case. But before he can speak to
the blackmailer, the crook turns up dead. As LeVine hunts for Kerry’s old films, he finds that the heart of
this case is even uglier than greed, lust, or murder. It’s politics.
 
In Hollywood and LeVine, screenwriter Walter Adrian seeks the advice of high school buddy Jack LeVine.
Studio execs suspect that Adrian is a Communist, and they’re lowballing his salary as a result. Though he
insists he isn’t a Red, Adrian has no way of proving it. LeVine is broke, and has no sympathy for his wealthy
friend, but he agrees to fly west to investigate his old classmate’s trouble. When he arrives, Adrian hangs
dead from the gallows at the Western set on the Warners’ backlot. Behind his friend’s death, LeVine finds a
shadowy Cold War conspiracy, and a city far darker than anything Hollywood puts on screen.
 
In Tender Is LeVine, Jack LeVine is just emerging from a vicious funk after the 1948 death of his father. His
first client is a German violinist, who visits LeVine out of concern for his maestro, Toscanini, the famous
conductor of the NBC Symphony Orchestra. The maestro’s memory is slipping, his conducting style has
changed, and his eyesight is suddenly vastly improved. The violinist suspects that the conductor has
disappeared and been replaced by a double. It’s an outlandish suspicion, but LeVine takes the case. After all,
somebody has to pay for his new office. Soon enough, LeVine finds out that organized crime is playing the
tune . . .
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From reader reviews:

Jimmy Hicks:

The book The Jack LeVine Mysteries: The Big Kiss-Off of 1944, Hollywood and LeVine, and Tender Is
LeVine make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You can utilize to make your capable far more increase.
Book can to get your best friend when you getting strain or having big problem together with your subject. If
you can make examining a book The Jack LeVine Mysteries: The Big Kiss-Off of 1944, Hollywood and
LeVine, and Tender Is LeVine to be your habit, you can get considerably more advantages, like add your
current capable, increase your knowledge about a few or all subjects. It is possible to know everything if you
like start and read a reserve The Jack LeVine Mysteries: The Big Kiss-Off of 1944, Hollywood and LeVine,
and Tender Is LeVine. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science e-book or encyclopedia or some
others. So , how do you think about this reserve?

David Hester:

The book The Jack LeVine Mysteries: The Big Kiss-Off of 1944, Hollywood and LeVine, and Tender Is
LeVine can give more knowledge and information about everything you want. Exactly why must we leave
the great thing like a book The Jack LeVine Mysteries: The Big Kiss-Off of 1944, Hollywood and LeVine,
and Tender Is LeVine? Some of you have a different opinion about publication. But one aim that book can
give many information for us. It is absolutely proper. Right now, try to closer using your book. Knowledge
or info that you take for that, you can give for each other; you may share all of these. Book The Jack LeVine
Mysteries: The Big Kiss-Off of 1944, Hollywood and LeVine, and Tender Is LeVine has simple shape but
the truth is know: it has great and large function for you. You can appear the enormous world by available
and read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

James Donofrio:

Hey guys, do you really wants to finds a new book you just read? May be the book with the title The Jack
LeVine Mysteries: The Big Kiss-Off of 1944, Hollywood and LeVine, and Tender Is LeVine suitable to
you? Often the book was written by popular writer in this era. The actual book untitled The Jack LeVine
Mysteries: The Big Kiss-Off of 1944, Hollywood and LeVine, and Tender Is LeVineis one of several books
in which everyone read now. That book was inspired many men and women in the world. When you read
this reserve you will enter the new way of measuring that you ever know ahead of. The author explained
their thought in the simple way, and so all of people can easily to be aware of the core of this e-book. This
book will give you a large amount of information about this world now. So you can see the represented of
the world with this book.

Chester Hassel:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make you to
definitely understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information quicker



to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, newspaper, book,
and soon. You will see that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. Often the book that
recommended to your account is The Jack LeVine Mysteries: The Big Kiss-Off of 1944, Hollywood and
LeVine, and Tender Is LeVine this guide consist a lot of the information with the condition of this world
now. This specific book was represented how does the world has grown up. The words styles that writer use
for explain it is easy to understand. The writer made some analysis when he makes this book. That's why this
book suitable all of you.
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