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Chaos theory deals with the description of motion (in a general sense) which cannot be predicted in the long
term although produced by deterministic system, as well exemplified by meteorological phenomena. It
directly comes from the Lunar theory — a three-body problem — and the difficulty encountered by
astronomers to accurately predict the long-term evolution of the Moon using “Newtonian” mechanics. Henri
Poincaré's deep intuitions were at the origin of chaos theory. They also led the meteorologist Edward Lorenz
to draw the first chaotic attractor ever published. But the main idea consists of plotting a curve representative
of the system evolution rather than finding an analytical solution as commonly done in classical mechanics.
Such a novel approach allows the description of population interactions and the solar activity as well. Using
the original sources, the book draws on the history of the concepts underlying chaos theory from the 17th
century to the last decade, and by various examples, show how general is this theory in a wide range of
applications: meteorology, chemistry, populations, astrophysics, biomedicine, etc.

Contents:

From Celestial Mechanics to Chaos:●

The Laws of Dynamics❍

The Three Body Problem❍

Simplification of the Three Body Problem❍

The Success of Celestial Mechanics❍

Birth of the Global Approach❍

The Stability of the Solar System❍

Chaos in Nature: Properties and Examples:●

Periodic and Chaotic Oscillators❍

From Mathematics to Electronic Circuits❍

From Meteorology to Chaos: The Second Wave❍

The Architecture of Chaotic Attractors❍

Chemical Reactions❍

Population Evolution❍

Chaos in Biology and Biomedicine❍

Chaotically Variable Stars❍

Epilogue❍

Readership: Advanced undergraduates and graduate students in nonlinear dynamics, and non-experts
interested in chaos theory.
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From reader reviews:

Anthony Collins:

This book untitled Chaos in Nature (World Scientific Series on Nonlinear Science Series A) to be one of
several books which best seller in this year, that's because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of
benefit onto it. You will easily to buy this book in the book retailer or you can order it via online. The
publisher with this book sells the e-book too. It makes you easier to read this book, as you can read this book
in your Touch screen phone. So there is no reason to you to past this publication from your list.

John Harrison:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always try to and must have the spare time or they will get large
amount of stress from both lifestyle and work. So , once we ask do people have extra time, we will say
absolutely of course. People is human not a robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity are there
when the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer can unlimited right. Then do you try this
one, reading books. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, the book you have read is
Chaos in Nature (World Scientific Series on Nonlinear Science Series A).

Ian Hall:

On this era which is the greater particular person or who has ability to do something more are more precious
than other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you
should do is just spending your time not much but quite enough to have a look at some books. One of many
books in the top checklist in your reading list will be Chaos in Nature (World Scientific Series on Nonlinear
Science Series A). This book that is qualified as The Hungry Inclines can get you closer in turning into
precious person. By looking up and review this book you can get many advantages.

Cara Shaver:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got students? We believe that that concern was
given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby. Therefore
you know that little person just like reading or as looking at become their hobby. You need to understand
that reading is very important in addition to book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to provide you
knowledge, except your own personal teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update in relation to
something by book. Amount types of books that can you go onto be your object. One of them is niagra
Chaos in Nature (World Scientific Series on Nonlinear Science Series A).
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