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In this 5,000-word e-book, the author of the bestselling Losing Small Wars looks at the problem of rivalry
between the top ranks of the Army, Royal Navy and Royal Air Force. He argues that senior generals,
admirals and air marshals have focused more on empire-building within their own services rather than on the
needs of the UK armed forces as a whole, with enormously damaging results. In particular, the UK
involvement in Libya was hampered by a total lack of aircraft carriers - sacrificed to preserve the Typhoon, a
fighter jet designed for Cold War combat that never happened.

 

Written with Ledwidge's trademark insight and panache, this is an incisive condemnation of the
British armed forces at the very top, and ending with some pertinent suggestions for how the UK could
reorient its military priorities.  
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From reader reviews:

Michael Walker:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children until eventually adult are different content.
As you may know that book is very important for people. The book Punching Below Our Weight: How
Inter-Service Rivalry has Damaged the British Armed Forces was making you to know about other know-
how and of course you can take more information. It is extremely advantages for you. The book Punching
Below Our Weight: How Inter-Service Rivalry has Damaged the British Armed Forces is not only giving
you more new information but also for being your friend when you feel bored. You can spend your personal
spend time to read your book. Try to make relationship with all the book Punching Below Our Weight: How
Inter-Service Rivalry has Damaged the British Armed Forces. You never really feel lose out for everything
in case you read some books.

Tracy Cluck:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive at this point, people have
do something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of often the crowded place and notice
by means of surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated the item for a while
is reading. Yes, by reading a e-book your ability to survive increase then having chance to stand up than
other is high. For yourself who want to start reading any book, we give you this specific Punching Below
Our Weight: How Inter-Service Rivalry has Damaged the British Armed Forces book as basic and daily
reading guide. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Sally Kim:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them household
or their friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, or even playing
video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity this is look different you can read a
book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book which you read you can spent all day every day to
reading a book. The book Punching Below Our Weight: How Inter-Service Rivalry has Damaged the British
Armed Forces it is extremely good to read. There are a lot of those who recommended this book. They were
enjoying reading this book. Should you did not have enough space bringing this book you can buy the e-
book. You can m0ore quickly to read this book from a smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book
provides high quality.

Harrison Johnson:

Is it you who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day by means of watching television programs
or just resting on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Punching Below Our Weight: How
Inter-Service Rivalry has Damaged the British Armed Forces can be the solution, oh how comes? The new
book you know. You are thus out of date, spending your time by reading in this completely new era is



common not a nerd activity. So what these guides have than the others?
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